
  

2/18/2018 English Announcement 

1.*We welcome everyone at this Church Gathering, especially those that are new. We pray that 
you will experience the hope, faith & love of Jesus Christ. Communication Cards can be 
dropped in the offering bag or in the back corner of the MPR on the way out in the silver box. 

2.*Get Equipped through Sunday School: Read the insert & join one by email or 
communication card!  

3.*Baptism: If you have trusted Jesus Christ as your Savior and Lord; the next step is obedience 
to Jesus by getting baptized. If you desire to obey the command to get baptized, contact 
jmillerrc3@yahoo.com.There will be a baptism class on March 11 from 1-2pm and the actual 
baptism all will be on Easter Sunday (April 1st). 

4.*Membership Matters: If God is leading you to become a member at RCCC, please contact 
PastorGaryLee.RC3@gmail.com by February 28th. There will be a membership class on March 
4th from 1-2pm. We would like to present 2 new members: Haji Nishikori & Jenny Su.  

5.If anyone need to enter the new expansion building during the business hours, please check in 
with our secretary Pei-Jium, 919-834-3815. Safety is our first priority and we don't want anyone 
to get hurt on the site. The building door is locked after-hours. 

6.The RCCC student fellowship group meets weekly on Friday nights and previously families 
from church has graciously provided food on a regular basis. By providing food, it allows the 
Christians to interact with the newcomers. We currently are in need of volunteers to provide 
food on Friday nights. If you are interested in helping out, please sign-up at the link below: 
http://www.signupgenius.com/go /5080845afaa2ea5f94-preparing. If you have any questions, 
please contact Cecilia at cecilia.c2@gmail.com .Any kind of help are welcomed! Thank you! 

7.English Conversation, ESL classes will be postponed until next quarter due to low enrollment. 
We continue to have need for future teachers and helpers. Training is available.  Contact the 
church office for more info. 

  

  

 
Youth Announcement 

1.Meta Conference - February 23-24 - Apex Baptist Church 
    Speaker:  Clayton King 
    Theme:  Here/Now - No better place, no better time. 
    Student registration and waiver forms are required for this event. Registration and waiver forms 

are available in the lobby at church. The deadline for registering for this conference is TODAY. 
The conference fee is $35.  Checks need to be made payable to Apex Baptist Church. Please 
give forms and checks to Pastor Jerry. 

2.Youth Parent Sharing and Prayer Times—Pastor Jerry invites youth parents to a Sharing 
and Prayer Time on one of the following dates:   

   --English Congregation Parents-Sunday, February 18 - 1:00-2:00 p.m. - Room 158 
  (Pastor Jerry will share the Vision of our RCCC Youth Ministry, Upcoming Youth Events, and 
the Plans and Goals for 2018.  He will also share how youth parents can get involved  and serve 
in the Youth Ministry.  And, there will be a time to pray together as youth parents.) 

3.Senior Banquet Tickets—Early-Bird tickets are now available for $5 from Sarah He.  Our 
Senior Banquet will be Saturday, June 2. 

 

Children Announcement 

1.New semester of children Sunday school began already .  We’re looking for people who have 
passion, love and interest in serving in the children ministry.  Please contact sister Becky Xie. 

2.Children Ministry has immediate need for the following service - Sunday school teachers, 
AWANA group leaders, and AWANA parent helpers. If you can help, please contact Becky Xie 
( text 919-244-3151 or email beckyfxie@gmail.com) 

mailto:beckyfxie@gmail.com


  

Upcoming Sermons 

2/25                                                        Elder Al Chen 

3/4                                                          Pastor Gary 


